
pect from them here at 
Marshview. 
There are lots of oppor-
tunities to get involved 
in clubs and activities so 
encourage your child to 
try something new this 
year. 
If you have any ques-
tions or concerns during 
the school year, please 
feel free to contact me 
via email or in writing in 
your child’s agenda 
which I check each 
morning.   
As well, Marshview will 
be hosting a Meet the 
Teacher night on Sep-
tember 18th. This will 
be informal meeting to 
visit the classroom and 
say hi. Hope to see you 
then. 
 
 

I am very pleased to be 
teaching your child and I 
look forward to getting 
to know them as the 
year progresses. 
This year we will begin 
with the Intensive 
French block.  
Our day will usually 
begin with Advisory fol-
lowed by Math. French 
takes place after recess 
with ELA happening at 
the end of the day with 
Miss. Chevarie. Our spe-
cialities (Music and 
Phys. Ed.) will happen 
in the morning as well. 
For more specifics, 
please check your 
child’s agenda. 
Our switch to the Non-
Intensive French Block 
will take place in Febru-
ary. I will send infor-
mation on the switch 

once it happens. 
The students seem to be 
adjusting well to Marsh-
view. It does take a lit-
tle time to get use to 
the school layout but I 
think they are getting 

the hang of it! 
We have been reviewing 
School Rules and Proce-
dures  as well as class-
room expectations so 
that the students are 
aware of what we ex-

Most days we will begin 
with Math. We will work 
on our critical thinking  
and problem solving 
skills.  
We have begun the year 
with some review of 
numbers and have 
reiewed the different 
ways to represent them. 
We will continue to 
build on to this 

knowledge by applying 
what we know to larger 
numbers. 
This month we will also 
work on estimating and 
discussing if our answers 
are reasonable. Near 
the end of the month, 
we will practice using 
patterns to help solve 
problems. We will look 
at equations and solve 

for unknown variables.  
Lots of learning to kick-
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  Math          

M A R S H V I E W  M I D D L E  

S C H O O L  

   WELCOME!!! 
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IMPORTANT 

DATES: 

· Sept. 16th-

Kickoff of 

2024 Go For 

42! 

· Sept. 18– 

Terry Fox-

Run/Walk 

and Meet 

The Teacher 

· Sept.30– 

Truth and 

Reconcilia-

tion Day– 

No School 


